FREEMAN AND FREEMAN ATTORNEYS AT LAW 12 WHITTLESEY AVENUE NORWALK OH 44857 419-668-4484

March 06, 2019 Invoice Number: 1398

HURON COUNTY REGIONAL AIRPORT AUTHORITY

Date	Description	Hours	Rate	Total
11/20/2018	Phone conf with Bd Pres re bid procedure	0 17	\$150.00	\$25.00
12/18/2018	Prepared Resolution for acceptance of grant	0.83	\$150.00	\$125.00
1/21/2019	unlocked computer Black out desc.	0.50	\$150.00	\$75.00
1/22/2019	call with Harry Brady re competitive bidding of snow plowing	0.50	\$150.00	\$76 00
2/1/2019	Reviewed FBO proposal discussed public records	0.33	\$150.00	\$50.00
2/28/2019	Worked on response to public records request	0.83	\$150.00	\$125 00
3/6/2019	Drafted opionion with respect to ORC 308.04 and ORC2921.42	1.50	\$150.00	\$225.00
	Amount Due	4.66		\$700.00



FREEMAN AND FREEMAN ATTORNEYS AT LAW 12 WHITTLESEY AVENUE NORWALK OH 44857 419-668-4484

July 05, 2018 Invoice #: 1453

HURON COUNTY REGIONAL AIRPORT AUTHORITY

Date	Description Phone conf Melissa James prepared and emiled resolution	Hours 0.50	Rate \$150.00	Total \$75.00
4/6/2018	Phone conf Melissa James prepared and semi-	0.83	\$150.00	\$125.00
4/18/2018	Revised Hanger Lease draft	0.33	\$150.00	\$50.00
5/10/2018	continued revison of hanger leases	1.50	\$150.00	\$225.00
5/10/2018	reviewed and drafted responses to public records request	0.33	\$150.00	\$50.00
5/25/2018	reviewed public record request	2.00	\$150.00	\$300.00
6/1/2018	Prepared commercial lease	0.33	\$150.00	\$50.00
6/4/2018	Revised lease	5.82		\$875.00
	Amount Due			

/H3291 7/9/13



FREEMAN AND FREEMAN ATTORNEYS AT LAW 12 WHITTLESEY AVENUE NORWALK OH 44857 419-668-4484

March 12, 2018 Invoice #: 1420

HURON COUNTY REGIONAL AIRPORT AUTHORITY

Date	Description	Hours	Rate	Total
12/11/2017	Attended Airport Meeting	0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
12/13/2017	Phone conf Ms. James	0.17	\$150.00	\$25.00
12/15/2017	Reviewed Grant Contract between Airport and ODOT	1.00	\$150.00	\$150.00
12/18/2017	Phone conf Ms. James, re certified copy of grant approval	0.17	\$150.00	\$25.00
12/19/2017	Phone call Ms. James re Grant Agreement	0.17	\$150.00	\$25.00
12/21/2017	Executed and Mailed Grant Agreement to ODOT	0.33	\$150.00	\$50.00
12/21/2017	Postage		1 @ \$6.65	\$6.65
	Amount Due	1.84		\$281.65

3/2/18 CK + 3290

Freemano AccroRWALK.com